Pl et et ed e

REZOLUTIONS, CONTRACTZ, LEAZES AND ORDERS
1973

F1-F3  JOINING SAN JUAN BASIN REGIONAL FPLENNING COMMIZEION
FROVIDING FOR A STNGLE VOUCHER FOR TOTAL FAYROLL
IRLIC WORME FUNG DECLARED TRACTIVE
17 RPURBLIC WORES FUND 1% REACTIVATED FOR JOIKT JUSTICE RBLGG
CaR PROGREMD
ORDER  ORMIZTEN FUND - RUTH LINDNER
DA OFINIOMN Fijf.'"...'--'.E-TEU FOR CLERKE IN RE ZALES & USE THAX
SCEMOLLEDSING WaDE DILLON - D&
ORGER ORMISTON FUND ~ SGEDRGE FEE
ORDER  ORMIZTON FUND -~ RUTH LINDMER ANMD DEMA LYRMN NEWEY
D‘ IMEMT DOMATIN FROCEEDINGE HWY 144

TaA~6 FAYMENT FROM CONTIMNGENCY TO AIRFORT
ORECER ORMISTON FUMD -~ DENA LYNN NEWEY
AUTHORTZING EXFENDITURE FROM CONTINGENCY TO AIRFORT
TREAZ DIRECTED TO FaY INVESTIGATOR RAZOR ON LIQUOR LICEMSE
GRAONTING LIQUOR LIZENZE ~ ML l[_"L' EfR DEA THE STARE AND LOUNGE
TEE GRANTING 5, 2% BEER LLICENSE ~ PRIEST GUL.CH DEA GREGORY
AGREEMEMNT WITH SITY OF CORTEE 'ID CONSTRUCT & BUILDING
DRIVEWAY FPERMITS
RESOLLUTION FROM CITY OF CORTEZ
ORDER  TREMAS TO TARE TITLE ON TAYX CERTIFICATE
FE-11T  T6aKE TITLE ON TaX CERTIFICA TE‘"
ESARD OF EQUAL TEATION
7a-12  TAY CERTIFICATES BE CANCELLED

v ORMISTON FUND DENA LYNN MNEWEY
ORDER CANCEL THX CERTIFICATES
Ur- MR ORMISTON FUND — DEMA LYNN NEWEY
v CONTINGENME FUND TO FAY FOR RESCUE ZERVICES AT AIRFORT

LEAA GRANT

AMNEXATION SECTION 18 & 19 T3IeN, R1DBU

RETATL LIQUR LIDCENS :Z GRAMTED BILL WILLIAME DBEA WILLIAME THL.

EXEMFETION TO =UDIVITEON REGULATIONS ~ NORMAN BUTLER ET UX
FUBLIC WORKES FUND - CITY AMD COUNTY JOINT JUSTICE BUTLDING
TRAMSFER FROM G&zI1 FUND TO CORRECT ERROR
Ta7d BUDGET

MONTEZ LEVIED

LICaLl TaX MONIEZ TO ADMIN OF PUBLIC SAFETY 2LDE
SUSDIVIZION PUSLIC LaMDS TRUST FLIND




THE BOARD OF COUNTY CCMM  SIONERS )
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA 49-% 1
STATE OF COLORADO

regular meeting of the Board of County Commissioners of Montezuama
r§ Celorada duly convened and held the Third —— day of Dec 19 73
h the following persons in attendance:

R T T o PRI g

Commissicners: Clay V¥V, dader . Curtis Honaker
and Hayold HeComb .
Commissicners absent: Hone

County Clerk and Recorder: _ Ce Ko Herndono__

Counnty Attorneyvs Grace 5. HMerlo

i o -

R

the following proceedings, among others, were Laken:s

WHEREAS: The Montezuma County Subdivision Regulations Section
7-12 in compliance with Colorado law proviee for dedication of lands
for sublic use within an anproved subdivision by the subdividor, and,

WHEREAS: The subdividor may provide cash in lieu of lands and
sh contributions shall be placed in a Trust Fund with the
County Treasurer, and

WHEREAS:  Such funds placed in sald Trust Fund shall bhe adminlis-
tered by the Moard of County Commissioners.

KO¥W TIEREFORE: Be it resolwed thal there 1s created & Sub-
division Public Lands Trust Fund createcd to receive casli contributions
from the various subdividors and others. Funds from the Trust Fund
can only be disbursed by the Moard of County Commissioners of
Montezuma County for aecuisition of lands for public use such as
scitool sites, marks, green belts, or play grounds. Funds contributed
by the various contributors shall only e used in those arcas effected
By thiat contributors contrilution.

Commissioners voting Ays in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader _ . Honaker and ¥cComb

P pr—

T,

Commigsioners voting Ways

gl fohole
Ll S aree

MW Eé}f,& il e Lol

Choag ty Clerk and Record of
Mﬂmtez_md.ﬂuﬂniyg Colorado

cartify that the above and foreq01ng Reswiution is a true and correct
CUPY of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board cf County Commis-
simreras of Montezuma Countv. Coloradn. and the wntoaa sinan @ama ave deman



Whereas during 1973, $23,197 was transferred from the Federal Revenue
Sharing Trust Fund to the General Fund, and

Whereas the purposes specified were:

Capital outlay $13, 197
Pest and weed control 10,000
Total $23,.197

and

Whereas the actual 1973 expenditure for such purposes were:

Capital outlay $ 8,750
Pest and weed control 6,068
Total $14,818

and

Whereas this creates an excess of $8,379. Now therefore be it

Resolved that $8,379 of the 1973 expenditures within the General Fund

for the Health Department be designated as expenditures of Federal
Revenue Sharing monies.



THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMI  SIONERS
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTw=ZUMA ji, Y
STATE OF COLORADO

"’“-m@tinq of the Board cf Ceunty {x:}xmxa*‘.maesm ot &
vado duly convened and held thﬂ day of i
-w;;'s o personsg in attendance:

Y

oy ey
R O SRV P N

g

CORET TR ‘if“‘C‘"" 20

o Uu"ﬁ{?m“f e
Shnving
Commisgsioners voting Ayz in faver of the Resclation were:
Aol ke SRS W G Sy N

Dommlasioners voting Navs:

pnngantore

above and feregeing Resolubicn is a true and coxry ec-’
it appears in the minutes of the Board of Cc;untv CQ. T

szuma County. Colorado. and the vobass unon same are ’-“fue



TEE BCAR® OF COUNTY COM SIONERS ] }

OF THE COUNTY OF MONTHZUMA # ‘Q/{
STATE OF COLORANO

regelar mecting of the Board cof County Commissioners of Montezuma

vty ., Coloradeo duly convened and held the _ 19th — day cfNovemberi® 73

thae following persons in attendance: )

Commissionera: Clay V. Bader , Curtis Honaker
and Harold McComb R

Commissiconers akbsent: None o -

Countv Clerk and Recorder: C. K. Herndon e

County Attorney: Grace S. Merlo ;

rhie following proceedings, among others, were takeny
WHEREAS, a budget for Montezuma County for the fiscal
year 1974 has been duly adopted and;

WHEREAS, anticipated receipts and expendlturesiﬁﬁg
therein documented;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that there is hereby
oppropriated funds necessary to defray all anticipated expenses
and liabilities of Montezuma County for the fiscal year 1974 and
carry out the programs and policies as approved in the Montezuma
County budget adopted on November 19, 1973,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that there is levied against
all of the taxable property within the aforesaid Montezuma County
as follows;

General Fund 10.50 M1lls /
Road & Bridge Fund 1.50 P
Public Welfare Fund 4,25 » ;
Airport Fund 75 " '
Contingent Fund +50 *

Commissioners voting Ayz in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader ] ; Hanaker and  felomb e

tomnissioners vobting Nay: Nﬁﬂ@

"wz {, L«é wj;/f

| / A L ST er
<iw€ﬁfzz%§;ﬂ#¥ W . };/Eﬁ5155525&§ p}ggéi

Conty GCioerk and chgﬂﬁ@r of
ﬁwﬁiﬂ“wﬁd Cotanty . Colorado

T mertify that the above and foregoing Resclubio: 1s a true and corract
uny of same as it appoars in the minutes of the Bugyd of County Commis
5 of Montezuma County, Colorado, and the votes unon same are e




THE IGARD OF COUNTY QO SIGNERS
e THE COUNTY @F MeNTEZUMA ?}/
STATE QF COLORADC

2t 7 regular meetine of the Board of County Commissionsrs of Monterzuma
Crumty, Colorado duly convened and held the _ 19th  Aay of Novemberl® 73
with the {ollowing persens in attendances:

Commigsioners: Clay V. 8ader coLurtis Honaker

and  Harcld McComb .

Commissionerg absent:  None ;

County Clerk and Recorder: 0. K, Herndonoooooooos

County Attornzyv: Grace S5, Merlo ) ot
rhe fellowing procesdings, among others, were Lexen:

WHEREAS, on November 12, 1973, there was held a duly
advertised public hearing on the proposed budget for MOntezuma
County for the year 1974, and:

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners has reviewed
the proposed budget and has revised the items on the proposed budget

in accordance with Colorado Revised Statute, 1963,

NOW THEREFORE B8E IT RESOLVED that the Board of County

Commissioners does hereby adopt the proposed budget as revised for
the year 1974, Said budget as adopted is hereby flled with thie
Clerk to the Zdoard.

Comriesioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution weve:

and ficComb .

e BAadBr : (SR aTz - P S 2 -

AT

Crmmisaioners veting Nav: | NUH&

/ -} ;
7 ;
/fj_,{d{ . ,,..,g«w* 7] ;’f

KMAM 7245‘%5/({;

M%ﬁ //@ 7\\/£f qu‘éf)?? /mé

o v o e

<t§ Clerk ard Re order of

couma Coanty . Colorado

. f: o . [—— e i oot A
carbify that the above and foregolng Resclution iz a rrue and correct

ﬁf.:nmo as it appears in the minutes of the Bﬁ&vd of County Commis-
VO ITEA ey viantov. L.Ql(:}l‘}“«ido. Al iz perboac tireyn EoTas BT e e




THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMY 'SICNERS , . /g
OF THE COUNTY OF MONT.ZUMA w73
STATE OF COLORADC

a regular meeting of the Board cf County Coamission

g of Montezuma
vty ., Colorada duly convened and held the  29th 4

ey
ay of Octoberio 73

*%@ following persons in attendance: T T o
Ceomeigsloners: Clay V, Bader s __Gurtis Honaker
and Harold McComb ”
ommissioners absent: Hone s
County Clerk and Recorder: C. K. Heradon . f
County Athorney Grace 8. Herlo . ;

che following proceedings, among others, were taken:

AHEREAS:  Montezume County and the City of Cories cre jointly
construeting a City-County Public Safety muilding: and

WHEREAS:  Montezuma and Dolores Counties and the five
municipalities within these Cmuntieg area JOlnt y assembling,
constructing =nd opereting a joint communications sveatem; and

v ‘:1}.1:412‘:
Fune& for t
these two projects.

N.“'wﬁ;REFORE BE IT RASGLVID: The project Director is
nerelw authorized to recquest funds <o bhe transferred to said fund
on & smonthly basis from all agencies contributing to &

tne projects.

These monthly advances shall be estimates supported Jy datao fur-
nizhed by the preject architect and enJiﬁsazug and the QmW¢th@m
zdministering s uch vrojects. Prior to disbursements from the Fund,
Ltetements,; and other recussts for

all invoices, wsts I wayments shall be

Iﬂ

aoproved vy the apporopriate administrative commitiees, The
Montezurna County Board of County Commiseiconers shall arprove vouche

ﬁﬁxikﬁzmyfmtsfrmauhvﬁmym

Commissioners vohing Aye in favor of the Resclubion were:

Baser , Henalker and McConth =
Commissionerg vebing Nays - ﬁone R
-y |
eyl (ked
.

{é s 7 "‘}?‘/ P R

(/:if%yﬁ’ v A ﬁiﬂé%fit{.kw /ifﬁfjﬁm

, il B
evk and Recorder of
Covanty, Colorado

s that the above and foreeoine Resclution a true and corvect
same as it appears in the minutes of the Womrd of County Commis-
rs of Montezuma Countv. Colorado. and the wrhes unon same are fvnes
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THE BOARD CF COUNT COML-;Z&;'J OWERS
OF THE COUNTY (; T LIGNT FA
SELTE OF COLORADO
At oa “ﬁgul“V'mﬁ@&img of the Board of Counity Commissioners of

Font Zuma County Colorado duly convened and held the 15th day of
O{i?:&,a:e.,;, 1973, with the following perscns in attendancs:

ul L 2 £ 5 - % i e ‘@ 03w Se 4 v “ i,
Commiagsrioners: Clay Bader, Curtls Honoker ond Harold Molomb

----- AN

e s3ioners sbhaents None
County Clerk and Recorder:  C. K. Heradon
County Attorney: Grace 3. kerlo

the following nroceedings among others, were taken:
Resolotion 238 1973

WAEREADZ: Hoyman and Lorne Butlery owners of 200 acres nmdre o

PO O wyrat s o N - s ol el =g 2
ess in the NBY, W&, Sg% aad a tract in Nwh, S&% ef Section 31,
o nin 37N, Range 14%W, H.M.P.M., desirs to sell 6.3 acres more

4 e to @
2z lying in the 8@ os said tract, sald tract to be sold o

- les
1 adjaceant nroperty ownser.

fp L3 b ke
L
T .

FEIEREAS:  The Montezuma County ﬂ&ﬁ“VinDJ Regulaticn pro-
vides that such division of land is subkject to these regulations
sroent 88 exemnt by the Montezuma umanay Board of Commissi

Wﬁﬁﬁﬁ%&: ﬁ?;ﬁuﬁ ut¢“r LﬁV&ﬂU amw&&r@d hafore the Monterwsna |
) pesting
exemption xlcm the Sa&&*v1uL0u ﬂéwvla;ionﬁ Monterana County,
stating that e is nol gubdividing his o A ﬁﬁtgu% of
the T@gu1atiansy huk is mevely transfevis
adiscent property DO enlarge same.

o

LEp N ko R s iy A
PRt u BRI SR O

N of Commissioners of Montesuma
County finds that this tx o is not within the purnose of the
Montesuma County Subdivision Regulations or State of ﬁ@‘ﬁ“aoﬁ Law
#nd it iz not the purpese of Novman and Lorne Dutlexr to oreste =
subdivisgion by division of thelr 7v$wvhty saelling 5.3 acres.
Thersgiors the Board hereby arants Worwman and Lovna Suitler 2 single
sremption from HMonteruma Sounty 3uldivision Regulations and lavs

“;&

i
of Colorado to transfor | nd deed 6.3 acres.

ey o 4 e 3 S 2 - ik - E o s . 27 vy T e de -
Compiasionars VOTING ,ﬂ"ﬁl’?} AN LaYor OoF UOs REeSnlluiDn warsl

Bader LKonaker and fcCors

Commissionaers vobing Nay: ___ hone

e"’{ }{} /

. ij;éz%i&/f f ?.wj!ff
/ﬂ‘z/j’u ﬁ/ﬁ‘”z 1z /ey
/Z/{? 4 f-’i‘i/i/ ;/;?7 Néﬂ—’wf l{’{"

County Clexk and ocorder of

Montezuwa County, Colorado

I certifyv thet Lh@ apove and Toregoing Resolution
corvaect copy of sawme as it apf@ars in the minutes
County Cﬁmwixwlonef of Montezuma County Colorado

-

WHon Salile are true end corradt.
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WHEREAS, by resolution on January 22, 1973, the
Board of County Commissioners declared the County Public Works
Fund to be inactive until such time as said Board desired to
reactivate it for some future capital project; and

WHEREAS, the City of Cortez and the County of Montezuma
have each agreed to contribute certain sums of money to be used
in the construction of a jointly owned City-County Safety
Building to house the Cortez Police Department, the Montezuma
County Sheriff's office, a branch office of the Colorado State
Patrol, the communications center together with the Municipal
and County Courts; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the Board to place
certain monies respresenting its share of the cost of construction
as it becomes due in the County Public Works Fund for distribution
to the proper parties; and

WHEREAS, it is now necessary to reactivate the County
Public Works Fund,

NBW THEREEFGRE BE IT RESOLVED, the Montezuma County
Public Works Fund is declared to be reactivated for the above
mentioned purpose to assist in the construction of the City-

County Safety Building.

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution

were Sader, McComb and Honakear.

Commissioners voting Nay: Nan%f? Wgz /7
/ ; = s
/”ﬁdff i ey o A

ot

,w‘.ﬁ;fb/ /Z/z’fa/ /“it{'
Q%;{i ff)"/?/,e;fﬂg »-h,.




RESOLUTION NO.

O
It was moved by Commissioner /V (Z'MB

and duly seconded by Commissioner }/g;i NAKE T

that the following Resolution be adopted.

g{'@ ’;".ﬂ{;{f

WHEREAS, BILL WILLIAMS d/b/a WILLIAMS TRAILER éﬁﬁé%,eﬁs
submitted an application to the County of Montezuma, Colorado,
requesting the granting of a Retail Liquor Store License, for
consumption off the premises of Williams Trailer Sales in
Montezuma County, Colorado; and

WHERFAS, the Board of County Commissioners of
Montezuma County scheduled a public hearing on said application
for September 24, 1973, at 11:00 o'clock A.M., and publication
and posting of Notice of said Public Hearing was accomplished
in accordance with law, and Public Hearing took place in the
County Commissioners Room, County Courthouse, Cortez, Colorado,
at the date and time as above set; and

WHEREAS, at said Public Hearing, the application, the
Investigators Report and the other pertinent material submitted
by the applicant were reviewed by the Commissioners. Testimony
was presented from the applicant, and no one appeared to protest
said application.

WHEREAS, the Public Hearing was closed on the same
date and the matter was taken under advisement by the Commissioners
and the Commissioners after reviewing all the testimony and all

exhibits, have made a decision in regard to said application.

WIMTT FERITOTY T/ rs TYED O TIM TYIIeE o TTTIvs ot " s . " =



for consumption off the premises of WILLIAMS TRAILER SALES, in
Montezuma County, Colorado, be granted for the following reasons:

1. MPesires of the Inhabitants

The applicant has presented a petition signed by
a number of residents in the neighborhood recommending approval
of said application. No petition in opposition has been presented.

2. Need of the Neighborhood

It is approximately one mile to the closest similar

type licensed business. There are no schools or churches within

the area polled.

Roll Call

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution

were: Bader, McComb and Honaker.

Commissioners voting Nay: None

eV F ay
f v 'ﬁ;; “/
{ M’éﬁ»ﬁf . f;%f"ém/

L .
o P . v T
;‘f:__,..z;é, iz /(1 7 o /f/ff‘s 91 :’-r:_' s;," \,;fg

™
;

) /g
_%ﬁfﬁmfif{’ it Lzl

{i;iifi;gzihﬁﬁﬁﬁéiﬂf

County Clerk and Recdrder of
Montezuma County, Colorado

1 certify that the above and foregoing Resolution is a true and
correct copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board
of County Commissioners of Montezuma County, Colorado, and the
votes upon same are true and correct.

(i;i ;fi{*qmyquéiﬁf

County Clerk and RecordeF of

WE e A o
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OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA 7 X - I3
STATE OF CCLORADG

» maeting of the Boesrd of County Commissioners of Montezuma

,f?ﬁﬂ duly convened and held the 24%h  day cfSentambhp® 73
Llowing persons in attendance:

Commuissioners: Llay V. Bader : Gurtis Honaker
and Harold McComb »

Compliagionars absent: Npne it

County Clerk and Recorder: (, K, Herndo... .o

Oounhy Athorney: Grace 5, Merla o ;

ot
M\
i
;-%;
A
4
-
Jnl
~

Liowing proceedings, among others. were taken:

WHEREAS: an application has been made to the City of
Cortez by a number of property owners in sections 18 and 19, T 36N,
R 154, for annexation into the City of Cortez, and;

WHEREAS: the County is owner of a 5.15A tract located in
the SW$ NW%t of section 19-36-15 that would be completely surrounded
by the proposed annexation, and;

WHAEREAS: all properties aggexéd will be elegibls far
various City services including poli df4d fire protection, and;

WHEREAS: a motion was reqularly made, seconded and
unanimously approved favoring the annexation at the Regular meeting
of the Board held on Monday, September 24,1973;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that Montezuma County join

those property owners seeking annexation into the City of Cortez
for the above property owned by Montezuma County,

Commisgioners voting Avs in faver of the Regolotlion were:

_ _BADER_ : HONAKER and____ NCCOME .

_ /{éa L’/ ‘;/iy&/ !

Goh T Porsariii..

&' %M s %/z:i*/é,eéu(ﬁﬁ‘égﬂ Y o ,:,,

Sty Olerk ant h@cmfﬁexl of
nhaxuma Couapty, Colorad

Commna s et

n
o
i
L
53

vobtling Nay:?

£ify that the above and foregoing Resclublon is a tyuse and correct
Vf mame as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commis-

- s -
e mF Markarama Coonnta . Caloarardn . sndd Phe gevbses e same atte o ~



OF THE COQUNTY OF MONTEZUMA

HE ROAR P COUNTY CON SIONERS -y .
T ROARD CF COUNT VD SLONERS %,’/‘37,«— u[/

STATE @F COLORADRC

lowing persens in attendance:

Commissicoers: Clay V., Bader . Curtis Honzker

meeting of the Board of County Commigsioners of Montezuwaa
whﬁmQCMmmrdewdhdﬁtmm“;vm _Bay oifeptember 1® 73

Commisglionars aksent: Ncne ,

County Glerk and Recorder: _C. X. Herndon : :

Counky Abtornev Grace S, Merlo !

S T e VWO

the following proceedings, among others, were takent

WHERFAS: Montezum2 County is Jjoining with Dolores County and the
municipalities therein to provide for a consolidated communication system to
system to serve all these entities and other nublic safety agencies, a2nd

WHERBAS: Montezums County is joining with the City of Cortez to
cenatruat and operate a City-~County building within the City to house b#th
the County and City law enforcement agencies, the Colorado State Patrol opera-
tion of the Montelores area, the County and Municipal Gourts, a combined jail
and all other facilities necessary for such cperations, and

WHEREAS: A seventy-thousand dollar grant has been made by the
Federal Law EnfTorcement Assistance Agency for the first phase of 2 consolidated
communications system, and

WHERFAS: Adeauete local monies zre not available to complete the
City~County building,

NOW THEREFCRE: Montezuma County agrees to seek means of transferring
the seventy-thousand doller L.E.A.A, grant for the consolidated communication
syastem to the construction of the City~County building #nd to szek a grant in the
amount of thirty-~five thousand de¢llars from the Four Coxrmers Regional Commission
for construction of the City-County building, Hontezuma County further agrees
to replace the communication grant with its Revenue Sharing funds and will metch
the T..K.4,A, grant for the City~County building if approved, with seventy~
thousand dollars County General Funds, such amounts to be adjusted in the over-
all City-County building construction budget to provide for egual sharing between
the City of Cortez and Monteguma County, All these actions are tc be subject to
the approval of all entities concerned in both the above-mentioned projects,

remnl ssioners voting Ays in favor of the Resolubtlon weres

Bader : Lonskes LLant MeComts

Comprissioners voting Nay:

S B—

f f/{&amd L/ 5 fﬁréiwf{

I '%“L ) J’H‘;Z/W’f.f

%/’zeg&éﬁ/ ¥ / i

o o A AR e s S

oy Cirers end Recorder of
(Mvw*ﬂ cona County, Colorado

-

v cartify that the above and fmrﬂgaln@ Resciuticen 1s a troe and cox
copy ol same a8 Lt appears iix the minutes of the Board of County Com
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WHEREAS: Montezuma County is joining with Dolores
County and the municipalities therzin to mrovide for a
consolidated communication system to serve all these
entities and other public safety agencies, and

WHEREAS: Montezuma County is joining with the City
of Cortez to construct and operate a City-County building
within the City to house both the County and City law
enforcement agencies, the Colorade State Fatrol operation
of the Montelores area, the County and Municipal Courts,

a combined jail and a consclidated conmunications and
record =zenter, and &ll other fawilities necezszary for
such operations, and

WHEREARS: A seventy-thousand dollar grant has been
made by the Federal Law Enforcement Assistance aAgency for
the first phase ef a consolidated communications aystem,
and

WHIREAS: Adermaibe local monies are not availalile o
complete the preposed City-County building.

HOW THEREFORE: Montezuma County agrees to BeeX IReans
of transferring the seventy-thousand dollar L.E.Z.A. grant
for the consolidated communication system te the construction
of the City~County building and to seek a grant in the
amount of thirty~five thousand dcllars £rom the Four
Corners Regional Commission for construction ef the City-

County building. ontezuma County rurther agrees to



replace the communication grant with its Revenue Sharing
funds and will match the L.D.2.%. grant for the City-
County building if approvsd, with aeventy-thousand
dollars County General Funds, such amounts to be

adijusted in the overall City-~County Muilding construction
budget to provide for acual sharing between the Citv af
Cortez and Montezuma County. All these actions are to
be subject to the approval of all entities concerned in

both the ahove-mentioned nrojects.



3

WHEREASY  Montezuma County iz joining with Dolorxes
County and¢ the municipalities therein to nprovide for a
consolidated communication system to serve all these
entities and other public safety agencies, and

VHERESAS :  Montezuma County iz doining with the City
of Cortez to construct and oOperate & City~County building
within the City to¢ house both the County and City law
enfercement agencies, the Colorado State Patrol aperation
of the Montelores area, the County and Municipal Courts,
a combined jail and a consolidated communications and
record center, and all other facilities necessary for
such operations, and

WHEREAS: A seventy~thousand dellar grant has been
made by the Federal Law Enforcement Assistance Agency for
the first phase of a consolidated communications system,
and

WHERBAS:  Adecuate local monies ara not avallable to
complete the proposed City~County building.

WOW TREREFORE: Montezuma County agrszes to seek means

of transferring the seventy-thousand dollar L.E.A.A. grant

4

for the consolidated communication system to the construction

v

3

of the City~County building and to seek a grant in the

f

amount of thirty-#ive thousand dcllars from the Four
Corners Regional Commissien for construction of the City-

County building. Montezuma County further agress to



replace the communication grant with iis Revenue Sharing
funds and will match the L.E.A.A. grant for the Clty-
County building i appreved, with seventy-thousand

dellars County General Funds, such amounts to be

3
budget to provide for egusl sharing between the City of
Cortez and Montezuma County. All these actiens are to
e subject to the aporoval of all entities concerned in

hoth the abceve-mentloned projects.



YHIRIAS:  Montezdno County Lo jolindng with Dolores
County and the manicipalitics therein to provide for o
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THE BGARB OF COUNTY COM. .2IONERS —3,\i:7
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA j 4
STATE OF CCLORADO

At a vegular mesting of the Buard of County Commissioners of Montezuna
Crnunty, Cclorecdo duly convened and held the o bth day ofSeptember® 73
with the following pexrsons in attendance:

Commissicners: Clay V., Bader ! Curtis Honaker

and Harold McComb .

Comnissicnars aksent: Nonse

County Clerk and Recoxrder C. K, Herndan

County Attorney Grace 5, Marlo )

‘.a
’“a

fellowing proceedings, among cthers, were takens

Whereas, Federal Aviation Administration regulations
have been changed to require fire and rescue servicaes at the
Cortez-Montezuma County airport, and;

Whereas, the Fire Control Engineering Company has
submitted the law bid for the above equipment in the amount of
$16,375.00 which includes clothing, tools, agents and expellants,
and;

Whereas, the FAA will pay $12,159.78 leaving a balance
of $4,215,22 to be paid jointly by the City of Cortez and
Montezuma County;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RES®LVED that the County share

of $2,107.61 be paid from the County Contingent Fund upon
delivery of the equipmsnt.

Commissioners voting Ayve in faver of the Resolation were:

____ Bader : Honaker Land | meCamb

(e ] /ol
%ﬁw ’?4’{:../4 A, ey

(%/4,4 ey Pl lonet

ity Clevk and Recorder of
Snteslna County, Colorado

Commissioners voting Nays

E’eig
\.J i

T cartify that the above and foregoing Rescluticn is a true and correct
xqu of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commis

DU - IR STIV=- 10 V NGV WP RAL PR ATl Avyadn anA Fhae rmybkaoc o eame avrea e



THE BGARD OF COUNTY CCMM _3IONERS

OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA L oas
STATE OF CSLORADG 57[ 73 -~} 3

reqular meeting of the Board of County Comuissicners of Montezuma
sunty, Celorado duly convened and held the | 4th  day of _genpt. 1S 923

the following mpersons in attendance:

Commissioners:  Clay V, Badex o Durtis Honaker
and  Harold McComb .
Commissioners aksent: | None o

County Clerk and Recorders: G, K. Herndon oo !

County Attorney: __Grace S, Merlo ) ;

rhe following proceedings, among others, wewre taken:

Whereas, Federal Aviation regulations to provide aircraft
fire and rescue service at the Cortez-Montezuma County airport
executed, andj

Whereas, the Y, W, Corporation has submitted the low bid
in the amount of $14,829,00 of which FAA will pay 82% or $16,375.00,
leaving $4215,22 to be equally paid by the City and County,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the County share of $2107,61
bhe paid from the Contingent Fund upon delivery of the equipment,

commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader . Honaker and MeComb .

Commissioners veting Nay:

f?&{imféz 5;%§%¢;%W/

! % M/A; ,Pjﬁ#fi«t‘ﬁj e ¥ j;%gw

foanty Clerk and Recorder of
Montezuma County, Colorado

T carcify that the above and foregoing Resciution is a true and corregt
w of same as 1t appears in the minutes of the Board of County CommLs-
s ~E MAanitasama OCatnty . Colorado. and dhe veyvkes mon same Aare hrue




/‘f ™~
1LwERS t A
CHEDULE Y.W. CORP, ROE ANSUL : FIRE CONTROL ENGINEERING
1 Vehicle, apparatus i !
tools, clothes etc. f 19,176.00 no bid no bid ¥ 16,375.00
2. Vehicle and apparatws 12,350,00 no bid  19,700.00 (1) i 12,003.00 é
3. Fire fighting tools’ 2,773.00 2,266.00  no bid | 2,225.00 !
4. Fire fighting clothes 583.00 472.00 no bid 460.00 r
- ;
S. Agents & expellants 1,270.00 - no bid included in 2 1,086.00 ;
. i
6. Radio 1,200,00 no bid no bid _ 'y 601.00 '
N "\ e

{1) not bid as per bidding schedule.
fighting agentsg bid.

'S

.& »

s

*

Truck and foam unit and extra chagge of fire



FAA will pay 82% of cost excluding clothes and extra

Total Cost 1low bid
less clothes
less agents & expellants
-TOTAL

82% of $14,829.00 =

: $16,375.qp less FAA share =

- y
“ TOTAL TO BE PAID =

% each for City & County =~

COST BREAKDOWN

© $16,375.00
460.00

. 1,086.00
14,829.00

$12,159.78
'$ 4,215,22
5 4,215,22

$ 2,107.61

agenté andwéxpellants‘



THE BGARD OF COUNTY COMM SIONERS '
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA ,_,;,[ 73— 1y
STATE OF COQOLORADO ’

ular meeting of the Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma
Cclorado duly convened and held the __ 27th  day ofAugust 973

TSN ST )
with the following pexsons in attendance:

Commissicners: Clay V. Bader Curtis Honaker

L

and Harold McComb

Commissicners absent: _None .
Ccunty Clerk and Recorder: C. K. Herndon _ :
County Attorney: Grace 5. fMerlo ;

rhe foliowing proceedings, among cothers, were taken:

Whereas, an abatement of taxes has been previously allowed
on Treasurer Tax Certificates #15753, #15754&, and #15755 and;

Whereas Treasurer R. E. Hindmarsh has requested the Board
to adopt a resolution to cancel the above certificates.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that Treasurer Tax Certificates
listed above be cancelled,

Commissioners voting Ay2 in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader . Honaker and MeComh e

Commissioners veting Nay:

;
£

Mdeg I Vo
jézM&Zaé‘;gé&y%ﬁ¢%&ﬁ

(Mo o sl 0 Lot~

Clerk and Recorder of
Colorado

T cartify that the above and foregoing Resciutlon is a true and corxrect
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commis-
aiemaers AF Manteznma Conntv. Colnrado. and the votes upon same are true



THE BGARD OF COUNTY COMM  3STONERS
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEAUMA . f
STATE OF CCLORADO 7

regular meetine of the Bocard of County Commissioners of Montezuma
nty, Colowado dnly convened and held the 30th day of July 19 73

©

with the frilowing persons in attendance: T

Commissiconers: Clavy V. sader , Curtis Honaker

and Harold McComb

Cemmizzienars absent: None
County Clerk and Recorder: G. E. Herndon
County Attorney: Grace 5, Merlo ,

= following proceedings, among others, were taken:

WHEREAS, the County may apply for a tax deed to mromerty smld under a tax
sale certificate after a five year period without advertising, and;

WHERFAS, the following certificates to the property therein described are
now over five years old;

NOW THEREFORE W& IT RESLVED that the County Treasurer be directed to mroceed
mnder the law to take title to the following properties:

Tex certificate #15368, Johnson, W. R. & Anna kae 1/8 Min Int Nii 14-36-16.

Tax certificate #15371, Leavell, Laoyd C. Ir adj Elk 23, Dolores.
Tax certificate #15378, Romero, Henry et al Lot 8 Blk 3, Dolores Riverside.

Tax certificate #15360, Smith, Mary Earl Melton  1/60 Min Int W% 33-37-17.
Tax certificate #15334, Williams, Joe & Kathleen A-Tr &4,35' X 100! NW: 30-36-15.

5 T PURTHER RESOLVED that tesr sale certificate #15355 issued December 2, 1968,
be cancelled zs the property described therein is non-existent.

Commissioners vobing Ave in favor of the Resolution werve:

Bader . Honaksr and HcComb

Commissiconers voting Nay: Hone

(o) oo/
//,,iz;% sy

C/%W / fiq’éil ak /f e (%@;’mf;

County Cierk and Recorder of
Montezuma County, Colorado

m;fﬂxfy that the above and feredoineg Rescliutlicr is a true and correct
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commig-
mimrnora AfF Mantasiima Covintyv . Calorada,. and $+he vatesas tinn eaama ara oo



THE BCARD OF COUNTY COMb SICNERS

OF THE COUNTY OF MONTrIUMA . /f
STATE OF COLORADO #7
At = r&gal§r meating ef the Board of County Comnissienexrs of Montezuma
Cmanty, Colerado duly cenvened ard held the 30th say of July 319 73
with the following persons in attendance:s o
Cormnigsicners: Clay ¥V, ®ader e deiiitils Honaker.

and Harold kcComb

Commissicners absent: lNone .
county Clerk and Recorder: C. K+ Herndon .
County Attorney: Crace 5, Herlo ,

the Exlliowing proceedings. anong others, were faken:

WHEREAS, the County may apply for a tax deed to property sild under a tax
sale certificate after a five year period without advertising, and;

¥EREAS, the following certificates to the property therein described are
now over five years old;

HOW THEREFORE ®E IT REOLVED that the County Treasurer be directed to proceed
under the law to take title to the following properties:

Tax certificate #15368, Johnson, W. R. & Annz kae 1/8 Min Int NE} 14-36~16.

Tax certificate #15371, Leavell, Laoyd C. Tr adj Blk 23, Dolores.
Tax cerbtificate #15378, Romero, Henry et al Lot 8 Blk 3, Dolores Riverside.

Tax certificate #1538, Smith, Hary Earl Kelton  1/60 Hin int MNWi 33-37-17.
Tax certificate #1538%4, Williems, Joe & Kathleen A-Ir &4.35! X 100! NWi 30-36-15.

o

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that tax sale certificate #15355 issued December 2, 1968,
be cancelled as the property described therein is non-existent.

Commissioners voting Ay2 in favor ef the Resolution weve:s

Honaker and ¥cComb

H

_ﬂBader

Cominissioners voting Nay: None

{(.J,@'w v, é,;%@/
féi;z2£?)j§€%?&5?%fﬁiWWmemm

County Clerk and Recordel of
Mopteruma County, Colorado

i certify that the above and feregeing Rescliution is a true and coxxect
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the RBoard of County Commis-
o d s e o BEmmds Amirma et Celarada . and dhe votas inon aame are true



CERTIFIED COPY OF ORDER -~ Sentinel u%, Colorada

At a_ Resular

STATE OF COLORADO
8s.
County of Montezuma

meeting of the Board of County Commissioners for Montezuma County, Colorado, held at the Court House

in Cortez, Colorado, on ... Ionday.. ., the __30thday of ... JULY e , A. D
18 73m there were present:

Clay V. Bader ___ Chairman,
Curtis Honaker Comimissioner,
) T

Harold Kelomb _Commissioner,

Grace 5. Ierlo County Attorney,

C. ¥. Herndon Clerk,

when the following proceedings, among others, were had and done, to-wit:

A resolution was regularly mzde, seconded and approved unanimousgly to
anthorize the County Treasurer to proceed under the law to take title
¥wofize on five tax certificates as described below:

Tax certifiicate #1536&, Johnson, W. ‘’, & Anna Mae, 1/8 min int
NEZ 14-36-16.
Tax certificate #15371, Leavell, Lloyd C, Tr adj blk 23, Dolores.
Tex certificate #15378, Romero, Henry et al, lot 8 blk 3, Dolores
Riverside.
- 'lax certificate #15380, Smith, lary Farl Helton, 1/60 min int,
NWz 33-37-17.
Tax certificate #15384, Williams, Joe & Kathleen A. tr 84,35! x 160!
Wiz 30-36-15.

Tax sale certificate #15355 was ordered cancelled as non~existent property.

I, C. K, Herndon

STATE OF COLORADO }
88.

County of Montezuma

County Clerk and ex-officio Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners in and for the County and State
aforesaid, do hereby certify that the annexed and foregoing order is truly copied froem the records of the
proceedings of the Board of County Commissioners for said Montezuma County, now in my office.

LT
- -

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Y have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal

of said County, at Cortes, Colorado, this ... S9th day of _ JULy

‘\ L CaD 10T @( % (;é/.,,?;

¥ County Clerk.




RESOLUTION NO. [J 1973 SERIES

A RESOLUTION WHEREBY THE CITY OF CORTEZ, COLORADO ENTERS INTO AN AGREEMENT
WITH THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA, COLORADO FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF A BUILDING,
KNOWN AS THE CORTEZ MONTEZUMA COUNTY BUILDING, TO HOUSE PRESENT LAW ENFORCE-
MENT GROUPS OF THE CITY AND COUNTY AS WELL AS THE COLORADO STATE PATROL, A
JOINT COMMUNICATIONS CENTER AND COURT SPACE FOR THE CITY AND COUNTY COURTS.

WHEREAS, the need for improved jail facilities in the City of Cortez and
Montezuma County as a whole has long been recognized, and;

WHEREAS, the City and County jail facilities do not meet the state and
federal standards for such facilities, and;

WHEREAS, a joint study committee composed of members of the City of Cortez
and the Montezuma County Board of Commissioners has investigated the
alternatives thoroughly for about six months including possible expansion
of present county facilities, and; :

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on July 18, 1973 to acquaint the citizens
of the City and County with the problems and possible solutions,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED AS FOLLOWS:

1. That an agreement be entered into with the County of Montezuma P
for the construction of a building for the above purpose on a . .-~
50% - 50% basis to include the cost of land at the intersection
of Mildred Road and Empire Street located within the City of Cortez.

2. That the services of Frederick L. Grove, arch1tect and I.D.

Longenbaugh, profess1ona1 engineer, be gﬁyygyed to design said
building. '

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS 24th | DAY OF July 1973,
_ & May::er M
Attest:

Qﬁ@sClerk(QB




THE BGARD OF COUNTY COMMT “ICNERS
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTE..JMA
STATE OF COLORADO

7 :L. e “!

Lt a vegular meeting of the Board of County Commissioners of Montezirs,
County, Celeorado duly convened and held the 23rd day of July 19 73
Wi t t 7 -

¥
he fcllowing persons in attendance:

Conmissicners: Clay V Bader , Curtis Honaker
and Harold McComb .
Cormamissioners absent: none

County Clerk and Recorder: G, K, Herndon

County Attornev: Grace S, Merlo

the fcllowing proceedings, among others, were taken:

WHEREAS, the need for improved jail faclilities in the City of Cortez and
Montezuma County as a whole has long been recognized, and;

WHEREAS, the City and County jail facilities do not meet the state and
federal standards for such facilities, and;

WHEREAS, a joint study committee composed of members of the City of Cortez
and the Montezuma County Board of Commissioners has investigated the
alternatives thoroughly for about six months including possible expansion of
present county facilities, and;

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on July 18, 1973 to acquaint the citizens
of the City and County with the problems and possible solutions, and;

WHEREAS, it now appears that a new building designed to house present law
enforcement groups of the City and County as well as the Colorado State Patrol,
8 Jjoint communlecations center and court space for the City and County courts
is desireable;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS that an
agreement be entered into with the City of Cortez for the construction of a
building for the above purpose on a 50% - 50% basis to include the cost of land
at the intersection of Mildred Road and Empire Street located within the City
of Cortez,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT the services of Frederick L. Grove, architect and
I, D. Longenbaugh, professional engineer, be employed to design said building,

Comrissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution weres

Bzder . Henaker and McComb

Ccmmissioners veting Nay: nope

¥ /__Z/,m,u I/ é’wg/ .
A /z/wyéﬁ et

% _Z, Polinaldl )" (oo

foanty Clerk and Recordler of
Montezuma County, Colorado

I caertify that the above and foregoing Resclution is a true and corirect
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commis-
sioners of Montezuama Countv, Colorado, and the votes upon same are true



RESOLUTION No. 7 3-¢/

1
It was moved by Commissioner ,4?/,6;/%32

and duly seconded by Commissioner ;;§ﬁﬂﬁﬁégfﬂz

to approve the following Resolution:

WHEREAS, The Montezuma County Planning Commission
has indicated the need for controlling the construction of
driveways to obtain access to private property from county
roads; and

WHEREAS, The Montezuma County Planning Commission
has prepared a proposed application for driveway permit to
be filed by the applicant and approved by the Montezuma County
Road Supervisor; and

WHEREAS, the Commissioners have reviewed said need
and proposed driveway permit application and have made a
determination thereof.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that effective
immediately, it shall be necessary for all persons who wish to
construct a driveway for the purpose of obtaining access to
private property from a county road to make an application for
a permit to the Montezuma County Road Supervisor, on forms to

be furnished by the Montezuma County Planning Commission.

Commissioners voting aye in favor of the resolution were Bader, Honaker
and MeCGomb

Comrissioners voting nay , None.

/{/rm g 2?5“ T A

(Mllosctny Lo
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RESOLUTION NO, 7'3:i/

7 7
It was moved by Commissioner /%fﬁffég}ngg

and duly seconded by Commissioner %;g//ﬁ{ﬁ(’

that the following Resolution be adopted.

WHEREAS, N, WINTHROP GREGORY and PEARL GREGORY
submitted an application to the County of Montezuma, Colorado,
requesting the granting of a Retail Fermented Malt Beverage
License for the sale for consumption both on and off the
premises at the Priest Gulch Camp Ground Store in Montezuma
County, Colorado; and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of
Montezuma County scheduled a Public Hearing on said application
for July 16, 1973, at 1:30 o'clock P.M., and publication and
posting of Notice of said Public Hearing was accomplished in
accordance with law; and the Public Hearing took place in the
Commissioners' Office, Montezuma County Court House, Cortez,
Colorado, at the date and time as above set; and

WHEREAS, at said Public Hearing the application, the
Investigator's Report and other pertinent material submitted
by the applicant were reviewed by the Commissioners. Testi-
mony was presented from the applicant, and no one appeared to
protest said application; and

WHEREAS, the Public Hearing was closed on the same
date and the matter was taken under advisement by the Commissioners
and the Commissioners after reviewing all the testimony and

exhibits, have made a decision in regard to said application.



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the application
submitted by N. WINTHROP GREGORY and PEARL GREGORY for a Retail
Fermented Malt Beverage License for the sale for consumption
both on and off the premises of the Priest Gulch Camp Ground
Store in Montezuma County, Colorado, be granted for the
following reasons:

1. Desires of the Inhabitants

The applicant, PEARL GREGORY, has stated that
they made application for this license because of numerous

requests received from inhabitants and campers in the area.

2. Need of the Neighborhood

It is approximately 10 miles to the closest
similar type licensed business. There are no schools or

churches within the area polled.

Roll Call omn )Zﬁ?agm day of July, 1973.

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution
were: Bader, McComb and Honaker.

Commissioners voting Nay: None

[y éq// oy

1222&14&47 //jézk?zfufﬁiﬁw

ﬂ;%/%,m,{ f’“;”’l

County Clerk and Recorder of
Montezuma County, Colorado

I certify that the above and foregoing Resolution is a true
and correct copy of same as it appears in the mlnutes of the

— B - ~ ~ = —~ -



RESOLUTION NO. 7 3-

/
It was moved by Commissioner //@'/\quf 1<

and duly seconded by Commissioner /ﬁ(?(€?ﬁ7zi>

that the following Resolution be adopted.

WHEREAS, ROBERT LOUIS MUELLER and LEONA MUELLER sub-
mitted an application to the County of Montezuma, Colorado
requesting the granting of a Beer, Wine and Spirituous Liquor
License, for consumption on the premises of The Stake and Lounge
in Montezuma County, Colorado; and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma
County scheduled a public hearing on said application for
July 9, 1973, at 1:30 o'clock p.m., and publication and posting
of Notice of said Public Hearing was accomplished in accordance
with law, and Public Hearing took place in the Commissioners'
Office, Montezuma County Court House, Cortez, Colorado, at
the date and time as above set; and

WHEREAS, at said Public Hearing the application, the
Investigators Report and the other pertinent material sub-
mitted by the applicant were reviewed by the Commissioners.
Testimony was presented from the applicants as to their past
experience in this type of business, proposed layout of the
building, equipment, number of employees, financial backing,
nature of their lease on the building, the character of the
neighborhood, hours business would be open, etc., Testimony
was presented from Sheriff Williams who stated that he did

not foresee any law enforcement problem arising if the license

TAMAA Mt T T ~A ITA Frrvdlne atndrad Fhak Fhoa ammldmnanmtd lad acwsand



to assume the cost of having an officer on duty if it became
necessary. Mr. Roy Brown, who operates a filling station with
his son next to the proposed establishment, appeared to protest
the granting of said application on the grounds, first, truck
drivers stopping at the Port of Entry located across the street
would be tempted to go there for drinks thus constituting a
danger to others, and secondly, that he knew several people
who had signed the petition asking that the license be granted,
had told him that they did not know what they were signing.
He did not know the names of these persons. No other persons
appeared to protest said application, and

WHEREAS, the applicants have agreed that, if it be-
comes necessary to have an officer present on their premises
during their business hours to maintain law and order, they
will pay for the cost of said officer, and

WHEREAS, the Public Hearing was closed on the same
date and the matter was taken under advisement by the Commissioners
and the Commissioners after reviewing all the testimony and
all exhibits, have made a decision in regard to said application.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the application
submitted by ROBERT LOUIS MUELLER and LEONA MUELLER, for a
Beer, Wine and Spirituous Liguor License, for consumption on
the premises of The Stake and Lounge, in Montezuma County,
Colorado, be granted for the following reasons:

1. Desires of the Inhabitants

The applicants have presented a petition signed

by a number of residents in the neighborhood together with

JEE VRN = VDT, SN, I SHUURY A JEr iy JRY o J. USSR sl ., [IOR Tp A L



approval of said application. No petition in opposition has

been presented.

2. Need of the Neighborhood

It is more than 1% miles to the closest similar
type licensed business, There are no schools or churches

within the area polled.

Roll Call

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution were:
Bader, McComb and Honaker,

Commlissioners wvoting Nay: None
W

/4&74/4 T4
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Gouﬁ%”Clerk and Recorder of
Montezuma County, Coloxrado

I certify that the above and foregoing Resolution is a true and correct
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County
Commissioners of Montezuma County Colorado, and the votes upon same are

true and correct,
( MC’% Mff’léf/%'f

County Clerk and Recorder of
Montezuma County, Coloradc




RESOLUTION NO. 1973 SERIES

£

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE EXPENDITURE OF $4,000.00 FROM THE CONTINGENCY
ACCOUNT OF THE AIRPORT FUND.

WHEREAS, the Cortez-Montezuma County Airport has received a motor grader

from the Federal Government, at no cost and,

WHEREAS, the overall cost of'repair and overhaul of said motor grader is

estimated to cost aﬁproximate]y $4,000.00 and,

WHEREAS, the Cortez-Montezuma County Airport is in critical need of a

motor grader for Airport maintenance,
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED AS FOLLOWS:

1. The expenditure of $4,000.00 from the Contingency Account No.
45490 is hereby'authorized.
2. This expenditure is authorized for the express purposerof over-

hauling and repairing the Cortez-Montezlma County Airport motor

_grader.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS /7/ DAY OF /i,g::%{ 1973.

Mayor

ATTEST: /2//,;&%;* // %2’@

- 13310n Chairman




RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, The Division of Highways, State of Colarado i{s making plans for continuation
of H:.ghway Ro. 184 in Montezuama County, Colorado. Which is designated ag Project
¥o. RS 0184(2); and

WHEREAS, It is possible that ocwners of land, meeded for Right-~of-Hay, will not
negotiagte and settle as to the emount of dacagees amicably; and

Whereas, It is possible that it may be necessary for the Division of Highwayz to bring
Eminent Domain Preceedings to secure Right-of-Way; and

Whereas; It is the wish and desire and policy of the Board of County Commisgioners of
Montezuma County, Cnlorads to cooperate with the Diviaiou of Highways in the improving
of our Division of Higlways System;

WHEREAS, It is the wiesh and desire of the Division of Highways in the event of Eminent
Domain Proceedings, that the Boar'd of County Commissioners, of Montezums County,
Colorade, should join in and be made a party to such Eminent Domain Proceedings.

ROW, THEREFOR BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of County Compigeioners of Montezumz
County, Colorado, ba joinad as Petitiomer with the Division of Highways, State of
Colorado, in the event BEminent Domain Proceedings become mecessary to acquire & Right-
of-way for Project RS 0184(2), Sec. 2, onm Colorado Highway No. 184 in Montezums
County, Colorado.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a copy of this resolution be this day forwarded to District

Five ¢f the Division of Highways, Btate of Colorado, Durango, Colorado.

eril j5 73
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Dated at Cortez, Colorado, this ey day of //
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Commisaloner
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Commiasioner
ATTEST:
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County Glerk and Recorder '
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THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMM SIONERS
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA
STATE OF C8LORADO

At a regular meetineg of the Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma

County, Celorade duly convened and held the _ 12th  day of March 19 13
with the following persons in attendance: -

Commissioners: Clay V, Bader , Harold McComb

and Curtis Honaker -

Commissicriers absent: ,

County Clerk and Recorder: C. K. Herndon \

County Attorney: _ Grace S. Merlo ;

Tf
e
{©

following proceedings. among others, were taken:

WHEREAS, Wade Dillon, who untimely died on Friday, March 9,
1973, had served this County in which he was born and raised,
faithfully, loyaly and competently both as Assistant and District
Attorney, and

WHEREAS, he gave unselfishly of his time, his energy, and
his legal skills, and conducted himself with integrity and honesty,
showing compassion, love and understanding for his fellowmen,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that this Board acknowledges
both for itself and prior Boards Wade Dillon's contributions to
his fellow friends, neighbors and citizens of this County, both
as a man, friend and District Attorney.

Commisgsioners voting Aye in favor of the Resclution were:

Clay V. Bader . Harold McComb and _Curtis Homnaker )

rommiggloners voting Nay: Nonﬁff

/ﬁ ; ﬁ leafféz//

éf/ﬁéﬁé}7’ ;%éf7uyﬂtf

(A rrier Fdnald 1 ezl

Coafity Clerk and Recprder of
Monteszuna County, Goloxado

I certify that the above and foregoing Rescluticn is a true and correct
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commig-
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THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMPF. SICNERS
OF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA
STATE OF CCLORRDO

At a regular meeting of the Board of County Coammissioners of Montezuma
Cruanty, Celerade duly convened and held the | 5th ~ day of March 19 73
Mlh the following persons in attendance:

Commissioners: Clay V, Bader . Harold licComb
and Curtis Honaker R

Commissioners absent: None N
County Clerk and Recorder: C. X. Herndon :
County Attorney: Grace S. lerlo iy

rhie fcllowing proceedings, among others, were taken:

WHEREAS, The District Attorney for the 22nd Judicial District is by
state statute the legal advisor to the County Clerk & Recorder,and;

WHLRAS, the procedure prescribed by statute requires county éfficers
to submit all questions of law having referenceto the duties of such
officer through the Board of County Commissioners;

N@YW THERFFORL BE IT RESOLVED that the District Attorney be recuested
to render his opinion to the County Clerk & Recorder on the claim
of Tldon E and linda Noyes for exemption to the sales and use tax
ordinance of the City of Cortez relative to the purchase of a 1972
Superior mobile home.

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader : MeGomb and  Honaker

Commissiconers voeting Nay: Hone ,

//quf&/ ﬁ,zéc/“/ 7
,KHQTC{:/ //f? Lz;/Lz,

Opl oy Hothitlinat

County Clerk and Recordey of
Montezuma County, Colorado

T aertify that the above and foregoing Resciubion is a true and correct
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board of County Commi.s-
@irnara nf Mantesima Countv. Cclorado. and the votes upon same are true



THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMM

SIONERS

OQF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA

At

Crsy

m

nty, Cclox

STATE OF COLORADO

recular meeting of the Bocard of County Commissioners cf Montezuma

with the feollowing persons in attendance:

Commissicners:

and Curtis Honaker

Cornmissioners absent:

Ccunty Cierk and Recorder:

County Attornev:

ado duly convened and held the _20th  day of Feb, 19 73
Clay V Bader ) Harold McComb
C. K, Herndon :
Crace S NMerlo ;

the followling proceedings,

among others,

were taken:

WHEREAS, The Community Action Program in Montezuma
County has been funded under the Office of Economic

Opportunity in years past,

WHEREAS, the OEOD is

and;

to be phased out on June 30, 1973

for lack of funds, and;

WHEREAS, many fine programs such as the Senior Citizens,
Alcohol Half-way House, Consumer Education, Opsration
Mainstream and Family Planning will be terminated on
that date, without additional funding;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the sum of $5000.00

be transferred from

the Contingent Fund to the General

Fund for the purpose of continuing the CAP programs on

a reduced basis for

the balance of 1873 and consideration

be made for inclusion of the program in the 1974 budget.
Be it further resolved that the budget for the General
Fund is hereby amended and like funds appropriated in

the amount of $5000.

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Re

Bader

E

00.

solution were:

McComb and Honaker

Commlssloners

(i:zﬂfi%éZ;uz4¢géi;ﬂ

veting Nay:

npne

Vocrd] Padc

44324 e :
/634;/54%2/6 270°( xwﬁ4~(ﬂ

Montezuma County, Colorado

by

o &\"p;fy that

+he above and foregoing Res

wty Clerk and Recotrder of

ointi a true and correct

(')

1O

is

copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Board cf County Commis-

a1 rnneyvra oof Moantoziama Countv.,

Cevlorado. and the votes uvpon same are true
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Connty, Celorado duly convened and held the _ 22nd say of Jan
with the fallowing persons in attendance:

THE BCOARD CF COUNTY COME STIONERS
CF THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA
STATE OF COLORADD

a vegular maeting of the Board of County Commissioners of Montezums

s e £ WA s

19 73

Comnissioners: Clay ¥, Bader

ang Curtis Homker

Commissioners absent:  nong

County Clerk and Recorder: L, K, Herndon

County Attorneys Grace S, HWerlo

she following procesdings, among others, were takan:

WHEREAS, The Board spends much time in signing individual pay-
roll vouchers each m onth, and;

WHEREAS, Colorado statutes permits the above approval by a
single voucher prepared to cover each payroll,

NOW THEREF@RE BE IT RESOLVED that a single payroll voucher for
each operating fund, i.e.: General Fund, Road Fund and Welfare
fund, be prepared by the bookkeeping department with individual
payroll sheets attached, properly approved by the department head

each month, indicating the total amount to be paid for that
period,

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resolution were:

Bader . __McComb _and____Honsker

e Br0ld MeComb

Commissioners vohing MNay: ) nona

/gébw ;f%%;‘féf” |
/é@ii’;& }2/?”?2/:?{ N

% %ﬂ/f &ﬂ%&f /7!‘%«&—;12 0 -

oty Cierk and Recprder of

Mo

N

“ugy o»f same as it appears in the minutes of the Boaxd ¢f County Commi.
i erera of Monterima Countv. Colorado,

rezuma County, Colorado

~oxrtify thet. the above and foregoing Resclution is a true and correckt

angd the votes upon sama are true



THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMb SIONERS
OF¥ THE COUNTY OF MONTEZUMA
STATE OF CCQLORADO

At a rveguler meeting of the Board of County Commiszioners of Montezuma
County . Colorado duly convened and hald the | 22nd  dav cf _|gpn, 1% 73
with the following pexsons in attendance:

Uomunissicrers: Clay V. Bader . Harold McComb
and Curtis Honaker .
Commissioners absents none

?

County Qlerk and Recorder: Lo Ko HEXBOOM oo

County Atborney: Grace 5, Merlo

the following procesdings, among others, were taken:

WHEREAS, by earlier action the Board elected to contribute
funds to the Montezuma Court House Authority, for purpose
of early retirement of outstanding debt; and

WHEREAS, such retirement of debt will effect transfer of
title of a certain portion of the courthouse facility to
the County; and

WHEREAS, the County Public Works fund has now served the
purpose for which it was activated,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, the Montezuma County Public
Works Fund is declared to be inactive and the County
Treasurer is instructed to allocate and assign all future
revenues relative to the inactive Public Works Fund
directly to the County General Fund. The Public Werks
Fund will remain inactive until such time as the Board

of County Commissioners desire to reactivate it for some
future capital project.

Commissioners voting Aye in favor of the Resclation were:

Bader MeC omhb andg  Honaker

E

Commissioners voting dJay: none

7 5
4«/4«51’2/{?5; l%ﬁ%ﬁf@tﬁ&%

Y& 7 lip i il 4.

Canty Gherk and Recofder of
Montezuma County, Colorado

T certify that the above and feregoing Rescauticn is & true and correct
copy of same as it appears in the minutes of the Bourd of County Commis-
e emeras of Montezuma Ceuntv, Colorado. and the votes upon same are true



alternates in this year 1973

! the 15th day of January 1973.

Resolution No. 1 Series 1973

WIHEREAS, Pursuant to the Colorado Statutes, the San Juan
Basin Regional Planning Commission has been created by the
Counties of Archuleta, Bolores, La Plata, Montezuma and San Juan,

all in Colorado, together with the municipal governments within
those counties, and

WHEREAS, Rules of Association of the San Juan Basin Regional
Planning Commission have been prepared and submitted to the
Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma, County, Colorado for
approval and ratification, and

WHEREAS, The Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma
County, Colorado has the authority, according to the Statutes
of the State of Colorado, to place the said County of Montezuma

in membership in regional organizations such as the San Juan
Basin Regional Commission, and

WHEREAS, The Board of County Commissioners of Montezuma
County, Colorado deem it in the best interest of Montezuma County
to become a member of said Commission:

NOW THEREFORE, Be it resolved by the Board of County Com-
missioners of Montezuma County, Colorado that the said County of
Montezuma shall become a member of the San Juan Basin Regional
Planning Commission and hereby ratify the Rules of Association for |
said Commission as hereby attached. Be it further resolved that
Commissioner Clay Bader of the Montezuma County Board of Com-
missioners is designated as said county representative with
commissioners Curtis Hona er and Harold McComb to serve as

Adopted by unanimous vote of the Board of County Commissioners
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,Commissioner
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Comm1581oner

ATTEST:
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County Clerk and!iRecorder of
Montezuma County, Colorado
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